
Bid Tab
Office Supplies

for
All Sarpy County Offices

Bid Opening:
2:00 p.m., Thursday

May 13, 2010

VENDORS
S&S Worldwide Office Depot Pay-LESS Office Quill Corporation Data Span

Progressive Business 
Techologies CDWG

Category 1: General Office Supplies

Non-Core Discount - Office Supplies 16.00% 45.00% 58.00% 10.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Non-Core Discount - Electronic Equipment No Bid 14.00% 40.00% 5.00% No Bid 15-20% No Bid

Non-Core Discount - Computer Equipment No Bid 14.00% 30.00% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Option 1: Category 2: Paper

Core Price Schedule Total No Bid $37,106.45 $37,827.95 $38,438.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Option 2: Category 3: Toner

Core Price Schedule Total No Bid $19,259.31* $27,442.71 $11,242.39* $29,583.59 $29,272.19 $9,745.24*

Non-Core Discount - Manufacturer Brand Name No Bid 24.00% 36.00% 10.00% Varies 5-15% No Bid

Non-Core Discount - House Brand Discount No Bid 24.00% 48.00% 10.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Attachments Included Yes Yes Yes No N/A N/A N/A
*partial bid
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